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ABSTRACT 
 

This study aims to examine the phenomenon of corruption fraud which is proxied by earning 
management in companies listed on the Indonesia Stock Exchange. This study uses the variables 
of leverage, capital expenditure, and profitability as key variables that influence earning 
management practices that lead to fraud and corruption. This study uses time-series data from 
2017 to 2021 and selects a sample by purposive sampling of as many as 28 companies listed on 
the Indonesia Stock Exchange. The results of the study found that the key variables of leverage, 
capital expenditure, and profitability, turned out to have a positive and significant effect on 
corruption fraud which was proxied by earning management. The contribution of this research is 
mainly to the management of shareholders, practitioners, and investors to predict the possibility of 
earning management practices that lead to corruption fraud committed by the company. The 
originality of this research is mainly in measuring corruption fraud which is projected by earning 
management, thus providing a reference for future research. 
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1. INTRODUCTION 
 
This study aims to examine the phenomenon of 
corruption and fraud characterized by earning 
management practices carried out by companies 
on the Indonesia Stock Exchange. This study 
specifically examines corruption in the context of 
a conflict of interest as a situation where 
someone in an organization or company takes 
action to prioritize personal interests over public 
interests without considering the values of 
honesty and fairness. In general, fraudulent acts 
that are proxies with earnings management 
practices are difficult to detect by the general 
public, so it has the potential to harm the public 
in interpreting the financial statements presented 
because they are not following the real 
conditions of the company. 
 
Based on this phenomenon, the research gap in 
this research is how to detect the occurrence of 
corruption which is a proxy by earning 
management, and what factors influence 
companies to commit corruption or earning 
management. 
 
From these phenomena and research gaps, the 
researchers are motivated to research the key 
factors that influence the practice of fraudulent 
corruption that prioritizes personal interests over 
public interests without considering the value of 
honesty. Several previous studies have reported 
on the key factors that cause corrupt practices 
through earning management, namely leverage, 
profitability, liquidity, and firm size [1,2,3,4,5]. 
 
Based on previous research and according to 
empirical conditions that occurred in several 
companies listed on the Indonesia Stock 
Exchange, the researchers have identified 
several key factors that have a significant effect 
on corruption which is characterized by the 
practice of earning management. The key factors 
used as independent variables in this study are 
leverage, capital expenditure, and profitability. 
This study fills the gap of previous research, 
especially in the use of capital expenditure 
variables, although this variable is closely related 
to the practice of fraudulent corruption, even in 
certain case studies, it is reported that many 
corruption frauds occur in investment activities or 
capital expenditure. 
 

The study identified several types of corruption 
by what it involves: bribery, theft of assets, 
patron-age, cronyism or distortion of government 
expenditure [6,7]. 

The reasons for choosing this variable as an 
independent variable are: (a) leverage, because 
of the consideration that the company wants to 
show financial performance to the bank that 
gives credit or fulfills the covenants agreed in the 
credit. This is what causes companies to practice 
corrupt practices through earnings management 
practices to show healthy financial performance. 
(b) capital expenditure, companies that make 
investments tend to show healthy financial 
performance, to prove that the capital 
expenditures made have produced returns that 
meet the expectations of the principal or 
investors. (c) profitability, a company that wants 
to maintain a certain level of profitability to key 
stakeholders has the potential to commit fraud 
and corruption by practicing earnings 
management. 
 
The results of the research on key variables that 
influence acts of fraudulent corruption through 
earnings management can contribute to the 
public or company stakeholders, to understand 
and detect corrupt fraudulent practices that are 
influenced by the level of leverage, investment 
activities, or capital expenditure and the 
achievement of certain profitability targets. 
 
From these contributions, this research is very 
important to do to show that corrupt practices 
carried out through earnings management are 
actions that are influenced by various factors so 
that those who want to detect corrupt practices of 
corruption that are carried out can see and detect 
fraud by using the results of this study. The 
results of this study will show how large the 
coefficient of each observed variable is so that 
corruption fraud can be detected through 
earnings management practices. 
 
This study also uses control variables, namely 
the level of liquidity and firm size, to eliminate 
bias in statistical calculations if these variables 
are not taken into account. Without taking into 
account the variables of liquidity and firm size, 
the results of the calculation of the independent 
variables have the potential to be biased, 
because the two control variables also affect the 
practice of earning management. 
 
The originality of this research is to focus more 
on the key variables that are empirical and follow 
the empirical conditions of companies that have 
the potential to commit fraudulent practices of 
corruption based on earnings management. This 
study also has novelty in the use of capital 
expenditure variables that have not been used in 
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previous studies, although in empirical conditions 
there are many case studies of corruption fraud 
originating from investment activities or capital 
expenditure. This is what causes the importance 
of this research, and is significant to be studied 
to be able to contribute to parties related to the 
impact of corruption fraud committed through 
earnings management practices. 
 

1.1 Main Research Problem 
 
Based on the phenomena and research gaps 
previously stated, the main problems to be 
studied are as stated below. (a) Does leverage 
have a significant effect on the frauds proxying 
the company's earning management practices on 
the Indonesia Stock Exchange?. (b) Does capital 
expenditure have a significant effect on the 
frauds that are proxies for the company's earning 
management practices on the Indonesia Stock 
Exchange?. (c) Does profitability have a 
significant effect on the frauds proxying the 
company's earning management practices on the 
Indonesia Stock Exchange? 
 

1.2 Research Objectives and Benefits 
 
Based on the problems mentioned above, the 
objectives of this study are: (a) To analyze the 
effect of leverage on the proxies of corruption by 
the company's earning management practices on 
the Indonesia Stock Exchange. (b) To examine 
the effect of capital expenditure on frauds 
proxying the company's earning management 
practices on the Indonesia Stock Exchange. (c) 
Studying the effect of profitability on frauds that 
are proxied by the company's earning 
management practices on the Indonesia Stock 
Exchange. 
 

2. LITERATURE AND HYPOTHESIS 
DEVELOPMENT 

 
The literature used in this study consists of 
theory and the results of previous studies related 
to the discussion that affects corruption fraud 
which is proxied by earning management. 
 

2.1 Agency Theory 
 

The theoretical basis used in this study is the 
agency theory developed by Jensen and 
Meckling (1976) [8]. The use of this theory is 
relevant to the research objectives, especially 
because this theory explains two parties who 
have different interests, namely shareholders or 
principals who want to maximize dividends per 

share or earnings per share, while company 
managers who want to maximize compensation 
receipts. Managers can manage the company to 
achieve the goals desired by shareholders, and 
managers will be paid a reasonable amount of 
compensation to be motivated in carrying out 
their duties and obligations. To achieve the goal. 
 

2.2 Signaling Theory 
 
Signaling theory shows that companies will give 
signals through actions and communication, [9]. 
Companies adopt these signals in revealing 
hidden attributes to stakeholders. 
 
The company tries to provide financial statement 
information, give signals about various factors 
that affect the company's financial condition, and 
communicate strategic and policy steps to 
improve financial performance. This study uses 
signaling theory to show that signals of the 
occurrence of earnings management practices 
can be anticipated based on the magnitude of 
the coefficient and changes in key variables that 
affect corruption fraud which is proxied by 
earning management. 
 

2.3 Corruption Fraud and Earning 
Management 

 
Fraud has a broader meaning, which includes 
acts of corruption and fraud in financial 
statements, including the practice of earning 
management. Fraud consists of three groups, 
namely financial statement fraud, asset 
misappropriation, and corruption, as stated in 
[10]. 
 
Financial statement fraud can be defined as 
fraud committed by management in the form of 
material misstatements of financial statements 
that are detrimental to stakeholders, for example 
earning management practices carried out by 
management for certain purposes that are 
detrimental to investors and creditors. Several 
views of previous research stated that earnings 
management is an act of fraud considering that 
in earnings management financial statements are 
presented according to the wishes of 
management, not factual (as is) with the support 
of generally accepted accounting standards. If 
we return to the elements of fraud (conversion, 
concealment, and theft), earnings management 
activities fulfill the elements of conversion 
(manipulating, manipulating) and concealment 
(hiding, covering up) even though theft does not 
occur directly (benefit yourself). 
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Misappropriation of assets can be classified as 
cash fraud, inventory fraud, other asset fraud, 
and expense fraud. 
 

Corruption in the context of this discussion is 
corruption according to ACFE or Association of 
Certified Fraud Examiners, which is the largest 
anti-fraud organization in the world that provides 
anti-fraud education and training and is domiciled 
in the United States. In this case, corruption is 
divided into conflicts of interest, bribery, illegal 
giving, and extortion. Conflict of interest is a 
situation where someone in an organization 
prioritizes personal interests over public interests 
without considering the values of honesty and 
fairness. In another sense, a conflict of interest 
occurs between two actors, known as the 
principal and the agent. The principal is someone 
who assigns responsibility or obligations to the 
agent. This relationship can occur between 
managers and employees, commissioners and 
directors, leaders and members, and others. In 
the context of an organization, conflict occurs 
when someone does something without the 
interests and goals of the organization and 
ignores the code of Ethics. This usually happens 
when someone holds a very important position or 
title in the company and uses that position to 
resolve issues that are unfair to other company 
employees. In addition, conflicts of interest may 
cause employees to act outside the interests of 
the company. The emergence of this conflict is 
bad for the reputation and image of a company. 
 

Earnings Management as stated in [2,3], argues 
that earnings management is a process carried 
out to take steps or actions that are carried out 

intentionally with the provisions of accounting 
principles that are still generally applicable to 
provide results at the desired profit level. . In this 
study, to detect the practice of earnings 
management, measurement with real activities 
earning management approach is used. 

 
2.4 Conceptual Framework 
 
Based on the literature and empirical conditions 
of the phenomenon under study, to explain the 
research gap of this study, the following is 
described in the form of a conceptual framework, 
to show the causal relationship between the 
dependent variable, control variable, and 
dependent variable. 

 
The conceptual framework image shows that this 
study uses three independent variables, namely 
the leverage variable obtained based on the ratio 
of total debt to total equity, the capital 
expenditure variable which is calculated from 
investment expenditure or fixed asset growth 
over time, and the profitability variable which is 
calculated based on the growth in earnings 
before interest. and taxes or EBIT. 

 
The control variable is used to anticipate the 
occurrence of bias in the relationship between 
the independent variable and the dependent 
variable if it is taken into account in the analysis 
model. The control variables consist of liquidity 
and firm size, which have a positive and 
significant effect on the dependent variable of 
corruption fraud which is a proxy by earning 
management. 

 
 

 
Fig. 1. Conceptual framework 

 

https://id.wikipedia.org/wiki/Kode_etik_profesi
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2.5 Hypotheses Development 
 
2.5.1 The effect of leverage on corruption 

fraud proxies earning management 
 
Several previous studies found that leveragetake 
effectpositive and significant impact on earnings 
management as reported by [11,12,13,14,15]. 
Based on previous research, this study proposes 
the following hypothesis H1. 
 
H1: Leverage has a positive and significant effect 

on the frauds proxying the company's earning 
management practices on the Indonesia Stock 
Exchange. 
 
2.5.2 Effect of capital expenditure on 

corruption fraud proxied by earning 
management 

 
Previous research has not been found using this 
variable, although many case studies have 
reported that corrupt practices are carried out in 
investment activities or capital expenditure. The 
use of the capital expenditure variable is a 
novelty in this study, while previous studies used 
firm size as reported by [16], and [17]. Based on 
the novelty, this study proposes the following 
hypothesis H2. 
 
H2: Capital expenditure has a positive and 
significant effect on frauds that occur on a 

proxy with practice earnings management of 
companies on the Indonesia Stock Exchange. 
 
2.5.3 Influence profitability against 

corruption fraud in the earning 
management proxy 

 
Some previous research state that profitability 
has a positive and significant effect on corrupt 
practices, as found by [8,18,19,20]. Based on 
these findings, this study proposes the following 
hypothesis H3. 
 
H3: Profitability has a positive and significant 
effect on frauds that occur on a proxy with 

practice earnings management of companies on 
the Indonesia Stock Exchange. 
 

3. METHODOLOGY 
 

3.1 Data, Population, and Sample 
 

This study uses a purposive sampling method, 
which determines the research sample based on 
the subjective considerations of the researcher 

with certain criteria so that the data obtained 
represents the state of the population and can 
meet the research objectives. From a population 
of 766 issuers or companies listed on the 
Indonesia Stock Exchange until the end of 2021, 
this study selected a sample of 28 companies 
with the criteria that they are included in the 
category of actively transacted shares on the 
Indonesia Stock Exchange or included in the 
LQ45 group. The data used is based on time 
series and cross-section for the last 5 years, so 
140 observations are obtained from panel data. 
 

3.2 Operational Definition and 
Measurement of Variables 

 
The operational definition and measurement of 
the variables of leverage, capital expenditure, 
profitability, liquidity, firm size, and earning 
management, is to use the following previous 
research references. 
 

3.3 Leverage 
 
Leverage is measured based on the ratio 
between total debt and total as used in previous 
research by [21,22,23,24,25], the following. 
 

Leverage(X1) =            

            
 

 

3.4 Capital Expenditure 
 
Capital expenditure is measured by the formula 
used in previous studies by [17,26,27], below. 
 

Capital Expenditure 
(X2) 

                                

                 

 

 

3.5 Profitability 
 
Profitability is measured by using growth in 
earnings before interest and taxes or EBIT as 
used in previous research by [20,9,28] the 
following. 
 

Profitability (X3) = 
                   

          

 

 

3.6 Liquidity 
 
Liquidity is measured based on the ratio of 
current assets to current liabilities as previously 
used by [25] and [21], as follows. 
 

Liquidity(X4) = 
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3.7 Firm Size 
 
Firm size is measured based on operational 
capacity which is reflected by the value of wealth 
or assets owned by the company. The variable 
measurement formula is based on research by 
[29,28,30], the following. 
 

Firm size (X5) = Log (Total Assets) 
 

3.8 Earnings Management 
 
The measurement of this variable uses real 
activities earning management approach as 
[31,32,10,33], in equation (1) to equation (5 ) 
below. 
 
Equation (1): Operating cash flow (CFO), 
 

CFOt/At-1 = α0 + α1 (1/At-1) + β1 (St/At-1) + β2 
(ΔSt/At-1) + et 

 

Equation (2): Cost of good sold (COGS), 
 

COGSt/At-1 = α0 + α1 (1/At-1) + β (St/At-1) + et 

 
Equation (3): Change in inventory (ΔINV), 
 

ΔINVt/At-1 = α0 + α1 (1/At-1) + β1 (ΔSt/At-1) + β2 
(ΔSt-1/At-1) + et 

 

Equation (4): Production (PROD), 
 

PRODt/At-1 = α0 + α1 (1/At-1) + β1 (St/At-1) + β2 
(ΔSt/At-1) + B3 (ΔSt-1/At-1) + et 

 

Equation (5): Discretionary expense (DISEXP), 
 

DEXPt/At-1 = α0 + α1 (1/At-1) + β (St-1/At-1) + et 

 
Procedure measurement of this variable begins 
by using equation (1) to equation (5), then the 
residual or abnormal is calculated from the five 
equations (ACFO, ACOGS, AΔINV, APROD, and 
ADEXP). Real value activities earnings 
management is obtained from the sum of 
residual abnormal as follows. 
 

Y = AREAL = ACFO + ACOGS + AΔINV+ 
APROD + ADEXP 

 
Where: Y = AREAL = abnormal or residual from 
real activities; ACFO = abnormal or residual cash 
flow from operating; ACOGS = abnormal or 
residual cost of goods sold;AINV= abnormal or 
residual changes in inventory value; APROD = 
abnormal or residual production costs; ADEXP = 

abnormal or residual discretionary expense; At = 
total assets at the end of year t; St : sales period 
t. 
 

3.9 Analysis Model 
 
To prove the hypothesis, this study uses multiple 
regression analysis models, such as the 
following equation model. 
 

Y = β0 + β1 X1 + β2 X2 + β3 X3+ β4 X4 + β5 X5 + 
e 

 
Where: X1 = leverage, X2 = capital expenditure, 
X3 = profitability, X4 =liquidity, X5 = firm size, Y = 
earnings management, β0 = constant, β1….. β5 = 
regression coefficient, and e = error. 
 

4. RESULTS AND DISCUSSION 
 
Before testing the hypothesis, the first step that 
needs to be done is to test the classical 
assumptions of multicollinearity, autocorrelation, 
heteroscedasticity, normality and linearity. 
Furthermore, after being declared as testing and 
fulfilling the classical assumptions in the 
hypothesis test, a goodness of fit test is carried 
out using the coefficient of determination (R

2
), F-

statistical test, t-statistical test, the direction of 
positive or negative influence as well as the 
regression coefficient of each observed variable.  
 

4.1 Classic Assumption Test  
 
The results of the classical assumption test that 
have been obtained are as shown in Table 1 
below, namely: (a) multicollinearity has been met 
with the value of Variance inflation factor or VIF < 
10 with a value of 3.45, Tolerance or TOL > 0.10 
with a value of 1.23, so it is stated that there is 
no multicollearity in the model used in the study. 
this. (b) The autocorrelation test uses the Durbin-
Watson test with the result that the DW statistic 
is 2.67 greater than the table DW (dl = 1.6445 
and dU = 1.7967), so it is stated that in the model 
there is no indication of autocorrelation in the 
regression model. (c) The heteroscedasticity test 
uses the Glejser test with the results of the t-
statistical test for each independent variable 
showing a significant level > 0.10 (X1=0.251, 
X2=0.452, X3=0.356, X4=0.245, X5=0.126), so 
that there is no indication of heteroscedasticity in 
the regression model used in this study. this. (d) 
Normality test using Kolmogov-Smirnov with the 
results, namely Asymp.Sig (2-tailed) = 0.200 
greater than 0.05 so it is stated that the data 
used in this regression is normally distributed. (e) 
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Linearity test, using the Durbin-Watson test with 
a statistical DW value of 2.74 greater than the 
table DW (dL = 1.6445 and dU = 1.7967) so that 
it is stated that the regression model used has 
met the linearity requirements. After testing the 
classical assumptions of multicollinearity, 
autocorrelation, heteroscedasticity, normality and 
linearity, as stated above, it can be stated that 
the model used in this study can be used to test 
the hypothesis. 
 
After testing the classical assumptions                       
of multicollinearity, autocorrelation, 
heteroscedasticity, linearity, and normality, it is 
concluded that the model used in this study can 
be used to test hypotheses with multiple 
regression analysis. The hypothesis testing 
phase begins with the model test used with the 
goodness of fit test using the coefficient of 
determination (R

2
), F-statistic test, t-statistic test, 

the direction of a positive or negative influence 
as well as the regression coefficient of each 
observed variable. 
 

4.2 The goodness of Fit Test 
 
The goodness of fit describes how well the model 
fits a series of observations made. The 
determinant coefficient (R

2
) of the goodness of fit 

as an important measure in the regression 
reflects the model's ability to explain changes in 
the dependent variable caused by the 
independent variable. 
 
The calculation results show the value of the 
determinant coefficient (R

2
) at 0.588 which 

means that this research model can explain 
58.5% of the phenomenon of changes in the 

independent variables of leverage, capital 
expenditure, and profitability to changes in the 
dependent variable of corruption which is proxy 
by earning management. The remaining 41.5% is 
explained by other variables that are not used in 
this study. 
 

4.3 Regression Equation 
 
The results of the calculation of the regression 
coefficients as shown in Table 2 can be 
described in the following regression equation. 
 

Y = 11.78 + 0.056 X1 + 0.087 X2 + 0.016 X3 
+ 0.721 X4 + 1.163 X5 

 
The regression coefficient of the independent 
variable shows the magnitude of the effect of 
these variables on changes in the dependent 
variable of corrupt fraud practices which is a 
proxy for earning management. Meanwhile, the 
trend towards the influence of the independent 
variables on earning management is determined 
by the magnitude of the negative coefficient or 
positive coefficient of each independent variable 
that is observed as in the regression equation 
above. 
 
The independent variable leverage or X1 with a 
coefficient of 0.056 indicates that each increase 
in one unit of the leverage variable or X1 will 
cause an increase in earning management or 
corrupt fraudulent practices which are proxies for 
earning management 0.056. On the other hand, 
if there is a reduction of one unit of leverage or 
X1 it will cause a decrease in corrupt fraudulent 
practices which are proxies for earning 
management of 0.056. 

 
Table 1. Classical Assumptions – Linear Regression 

 

Classical Assumtion 

 a. Multicollinearity   
 - VIF 3.45 
 - Tolerance 1.20 
b. Aotocorrelatio   
 - Durbin-Watson Satatistic 2.67 
c. Heteroscedasticity Sig. 
 - Leverage (X1) 0.251 
 - Capital Expenditure (X2) 0.452 
 - Profitability (X3) 0.356 
 - Liquidity (X4) 0.245 
 - Firm size (X5) 0.126 
d. Normality   
 - Asymp. Sig (2-tailed) 0.200 
e. Linearity   
 - Durbin-Watson Satatistic 2.74 



 
 
 
 

Assagaf et al.; AJEBA, 22(20): 78-90, 2022; Article no.AJEBA.89737 
 

 

 
85 

 

The independent variable capital expenditure or 
X2 with a coefficient of 0.087 indicates that each 
increase of one unit of the capital expenditure 
variable or X2 will cause an increase in earning 
management or corrupt practices which are 
proxies for earning management 0.087. On the 
other hand, if there is a reduction of one unit of 
capital expenditure or X2, it will cause a 
decrease in corrupt fraudulent practices which 
are proxies for earning management of 0.087. 
 
The independent variable profitability leverage or 
X3 with a coefficient of 0.016 indicates that each 
increase of one unit of profitability or X3 variable 
will cause an increase in earning management or 
fraudulent practices of corruption which is 
proxied by earning management 0.016. On the 
other hand, if there is a reduction of one unit of 
profitability or X3, it will cause a decrease in the 
practice of corrupt fraud which is a proxy for 
earning management of 0.016. 
 
The liquidity control variable or X4 with a 
coefficient of 0.721 indicates that each increase 
in one unit of the liquidity variable or X4 will 
cause an increase in earning management or 
fraudulent practices of corruption which are 
proxies with earning management of 0.721. On 
the other hand, if there is a reduction of one 
liquidity unit or X4 it will cause a decrease in 
corrupt fraud practices which are proxied by 
earning management of 0.721. 
 
The control variable firm size or X5 with a 
coefficient of 1.163 indicates that each additional 
unit of firm size variable or X5 will cause an 
increase in earnings management or corrupt 
fraudulent practices which are proxied by 
earnings management of 1.163. On the other 

hand, if there is a reduction of one firm size or 
X5, it will cause a decrease in corrupt fraudulent 
practices which are proxy with earnings 
management of 1,163. 
 
Based on the regression coefficient, it can be 
used to predict the level of earning management 
if there is a change or if the value of each 
independent variable is known. For example, by 
using the realization data of the last independent 
variable, it is possible to predict the value of 
management earnings or the level of corruption 
fraud committed by companies on the Indonesia 
Stock Exchange or IDX. The prediction results 
are then compared with the realization of the 
earning management value of each company 
that is the research sample. The deviation 
between the predicted value and the realized 
value indicates the level of deviation, which 
means that the smaller the difference, the closer 
to reality, for example, a deviation of about 1% to 
5%, it can be stated that this research can be 
used by management or agents, company 
owners or principals, and other stakeholders to 
predict the possibility of corruption fraud as a 
proxy for earning management. If a deviation of 
1% is achieved, it can be stated that the possible 
deviation that will occur between the realized 
value and the predicted value is in the range of 
1%. Expressed as an inaccurate prediction, if the 
deviation between realization and prediction is 
relatively high, for example, exceeds 10%. A 
relatively high deviation, for example, more than 
10%, means that the probability that the 
realization will deviate from the prediction is quite 
large, making it difficult to believe, which means 
that the greater the value of the deviation, the 
lower the level of accuracy. and other 
stakeholders to predict the possibility of

 
Table 2. Factors affecting earnings management 

 
Y = β0 + β1 X1 + β2 X2 + β3 X3+ β4 X4 + β5 X5 + e 

 

Variables Predict Coefficient Sig. 

(Constant)   11.782 0.619 
X1 + 0.056 0.001 
X2 + 0.087 0.001 
X3 + 0.016 0.005 
X4 + 0.721 0.838 
X5 + 1.163 0.614 
F-Statistics   40.60 0.000 
Adjusted R Square     0.588 
Dependent Variable : Y   

Source: Company's financial statements on the Indonesia Stock Exchange in 2017 - 2021 
Where: X1= leverage, X2= capital expenditure, X3= profitability, X4=liquidity, X5= firm size, Y= earnings 

management 
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corruption fraud which is a proxy by earning 
management. If a deviation of 1% is achieved, it 
can be stated that the possible deviation that will 
occur between the realized value and the 
predicted value is in the range of 1%. Expressed 
as an inaccurate prediction, if the deviation 
between realization and prediction is relatively 
high, for example, exceeds 10%. A relatively high 
deviation, for example, more than 10%, means 
that the probability that the realization will deviate 
from the prediction is quite large, making it 
difficult to believe, which means that the greater 
the value of the deviation, the lower the level of 
accuracy. and other stakeholders to predict the 
possibility of corruption fraud which is a proxy by 
earning management. If a deviation of 1% is 
achieved, it can be stated that the possible 
deviation that will occur between the realized 
value and the predicted value is in the range of 
1%. Expressed as an inaccurate prediction, if the 
deviation between realization and prediction is 
relatively high, for example, exceeds 10%. A 
relatively high deviation, for example, more than 
10%, means that the probability that the 
realization will deviate from the prediction is quite 
large, making it difficult to believe, which means 
that the greater the value of the deviation, the 
lower the level of accuracy. it can be stated that 
the possible deviation that will occur between the 
realized value and the predicted value is in the 
range of 1%. Expressed as an inaccurate 
prediction, if the deviation between realization 
and prediction is relatively high, for example, 
exceeds 10%. A relatively high deviation, for 
example, more than 10%, means that the 
probability that the realization will deviate from 
the prediction is quite large, making it difficult to 
believe, which means that the greater the value 
of the deviation, the lower the level of accuracy. it 
can be stated that the possible deviation that will 
occur between the realized value and the 
predicted value is in the range of 1%. Expressed 
as an inaccurate prediction, if the deviation 
between realization and prediction is relatively 
high, for example, exceeds 10%. A relatively high 
deviation, for example, more than 10%, means 
that the probability that the realization will deviate 
from the prediction is quite large, making it 
difficult to believe, which means that the greater 
the value of the deviation, the lower the level of 
accuracy. 
 

4.4 F-Statistics Test 
 
Simultaneous hypothesis testing shows that the 
influence of the independent variable and the 
control variable has a significant effect on 

corruption fraud as a proxy for earning 
management, as well as the F-statistic test with a 
value of 40.6 at a significant level of 0.000. This 
shows that the overall independent variables and 
control variables consisting of leverage, capital 
expenditure, profitability, liquidity, and firm size 
simultaneously have a significant effect on the 
practice of corruption fraud which is proxied by 
company earnings management on the 
Indonesia Stock Exchange. 
 

4.5 t-Statistic Test 
 
The discussion of research results to prove the 
H1, H2, and H3 hypotheses was carried out 
using the t-statistic test, namely a partial test of 
the effect of the independent variables leverage, 
capital expenditure, and profitability on the 
dependent variable of corruption fraud as a proxy 
for earning management. The results of the 
hypothesis test are declared to be accepted or 
according to predictions if the direction of the 
positive or negative influence is following the 
calculation results. Furthermore, hypotheses H1, 
H2, and H3 support the hypothesis that the 
independent variables leverage, capital 
expenditure, and profitability have a significant 
effect on the dependent variable corruption which 
is proxied as earnings management, at a level 
less than or equal to 0.05 or 5%, where the t-
statistic value is greater of the t-table values, as 
stated below. 
 

4.6 The Effect of Leverage on Corruption 
or Earning Management Practices 
(Hypothesis H1) 

 
The results of the t-statistical test calculation 
show that the leverage variable has a positive 
effect with a regression coefficient of 0.056 and a 
significance level of 0.001. This means that the 
findings in this study are following the predictions 
and support the H1 hypothesis, namely the 
leverage variable has a positive and significant 
effect on corruption or earning management 
practices. 
 

Empirically it is proven that the greater the 
leverage or the higher the composition of the use 
of debt to total assets, the higher the earning 
management practice or fraudulent corruption 
committed by the company in the presentation of 
financial statements. This is done to show 
financial institution lenders that the company can 
meet the covenant target in the form of achieving 
a certain level of profit, for example, return on 
investment or ROI is required to reach a certain 
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percentage, so that company management is 
encouraged to commit fraud or corruption 
through earning management practices in the 
presentation of annual financial statements.  
 

4.7 Effect of Capital Expenditure on 
Corruption or earning Management 
Practices (Hypothesis H2) 

 
The results of the calculation of the t-statistical 
test show that the capital expenditure variable 
has a positive effect with a regression coefficient 
of 0.087 and a significance level of 0.001. This 
means that the findings in this study are following 
the predictions and support hypothesis H2, 
namely the capital expenditure variable has a 
positive and significant effect on corruption or 
earning management practices. 
 
Empirically it is proven that the greater the capital 
expenditure, the higher the earning management 
practice or corruption fraud committed by the 
company in the presentation of financial 
statements. This is done to show investors or 
shareholders that the investment or capital 
expenditure can generate a decent or relatively 
high return. This is what drives the company's 
management to commit fraud or corruption 
through the practice of earning management in 
the presentation of the annual financial 
statements. 
 

4.8 The Effect of Profitability on 
Corruption or Earning Management 
Practices (Hypothesis H3) 

 
The results of the t-statistical test calculation 
show that the profitability variable has a positive 
effect on corruption fraud with a regression 
coefficient of 0.016 and a significance level of 
0.005. This means that the findings in this study 
are following the predictions and support the H3 
hypothesis, namely the profitability variable has a 
positive and significant effect on corruption or 
earning management practices. 
 
Empirically it is proven that the greater the 
achievement of profitability, the higher the 
earning management practice or fraudulent 
corruption committed by the company in the 
presentation of financial statements. This is done 
to show shareholders that the profitability 
achieved is capable of producing decent or 
relatively high profitability. The higher the target 
for achieving the company's profitability, the 
higher the incentive for company management to 

commit fraud or corruption through the practice 
of earning management in the presentation of 
annual financial statements. 
 

4.9 Effect of the Control Variable 
 
The control variables consisting of liquidity and 
firm size have no significant effect on fraud, 
corruption, or earning management practices. 
This is mainly due to the liquidity variable and 
firm size variable which are not directly related to 
the corruption fraud projected by earning 
management practices. The liquidity variable is 
used as a comparison between current assets 
and current liabilities while earning management 
is carried out to influence income and costs in 
recording or reporting, so it can be stated that the 
liquidity variable has no significant effect on 
earning management practices [34,35]. The firm 
size variable, which is measured based on the 
logarithm of total assets, does not appear to be 
directly related to earning management practices 
that regulate the accounting records of income 
and costs. 
 

5. CONCLUSION 
 

The results of this study have proven the 
hypothesis that the identified key variables affect 
the dependent variable of corruption fraud which 
is a proxy for earning management, which can be 
concluded as follows. 
 

a. Leverage variable has a positive effect on 
corruption fraud which is proxy with 
practice earnings management with a 
coefficient of 0.056 and a significant level 
of 0.001. This means that a high level of 
leverage will encourage an increase in 
practice earnings management carried out 
by companies on the Indonesia Stock 
Exchange. 

b. The capital expenditure variable has a 
positive effect on corruption fraud which is 
a proxy with practice earnings 
management with a coefficient of 0.087 
and a significant level of 0.001. This 
means that an increase in the amount of 
investment or capital expenditure will 
encourage an increase in practice earnings 
management carried out by companies on 
the Indonesia Stock Exchange. 

c. Variable profitability has a positive effect 
on corruption fraud which is proxied by 
practice earnings management with a 
coefficient of 0.056 and a significant level 
of 0.005. This means that the level of 
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profitability high will encourage an increase 
in practice earning management to 
maintain performance and management 
performance appraisal by the company's 
main stakeholders on the Indonesia Stock 
Exchange. 

 
6. IMPLICATIONS  
 
With this research, the managerial implication 
that arises is that the company's management 
must be careful when carrying out corrupt 
fraudulent practices, because these actions can 
be detected through variables that affect corrupt 
fraudulent practices projected by earning 
management. 

 
7. LIMITATION 
 
This study has limitations mainly due to the 
limited use of secondary data according to 
financial statement information published via the 
internet. It is necessary to support data obtained 
from primary data sources related to internal 
management policies in earnings management 
practices carried out by companies listed on the 
Indonesia Stock Exchange. For this reason, it is 
necessary to continue this research using 
primary data directly obtained from the 
company's key person, so that more realistic 
results are obtained and at the same time 
complement this research. 
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